
 1 

 
 

 
 

LABOR FINDS ITS VOICE 
 
 

 
Cover of Harper's magazine picturing the Homestead Strike 

 
 

 
Unit Overview  
The rapid growth of industry in the United States during the late nineteenth century 
resulted in an equally rapid rise in the number of industrial workers.  Little government 
regulation and a desire for greater profits caused most corporate executives to ignore the 
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concerns of their workforce.  Employees recognized the importance of unity and joined 
organizations like the Knights of Labor and the American Federation of Labor to demand 
an eight-hour day, safer working conditions and wages.  Let’s see how it all happened.    
 
 
Labor’s Growing Discontent 
Author Mark Twain referred to the last three decades of the nineteenth century as the 
Gilded Age.  He meant that industrialism had achieved glittering results on the surface 
but was supported by corruption and poverty.  While corporate executives amassed great 
wealth, workers struggled with low wages, long hours and hazardous conditions.  
Women, African Americans, children and immigrants often earned less than $1 a day.  
Mass production and the assembly line forced employees to perform the same tasks over 
and over; decision making and creative thinking remained in the hands of management.  
Tension between companies and employees surfaced and sometimes escalated to 
violence.  The Great Railroad Strike of 1877 is one example.   
 
 

 
 
 

 
The Great Railroad Strike of 1877 was not only the first rail strike in the nation’s history 
but also the country’s first general strike.  In the years immediately following the Civil 
War, the United States experienced a boom in railroad construction that led investors to 
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speculate and to borrow money based on proposed projects.  The bubble burst when the 
Northern Pacific Railroad filed for bankruptcy in 1873.  This set off a financial panic that 
closed the New York Stock Exchange for ten days and plunged the American economy 
into a depression.  In 1877, the Supreme Court upheld a series of laws that regulated 
railroad rates, and this also adversely affected rail profits.  The Pennsylvania Railroad 
responded by doubling the size of trains and by cutting the salaries of employees.  Other 
companies soon followed this example. 
 
The new company policy caused thousands of railroad workers to walk off their jobs in 
protest.  The strike was not affiliated with any union, but it paralyzed the transportation 
network and brought U.S. commerce to a screeching halt.  The Great Railroad Strike 
drew over 100,000 participants in fourteen states.  In major cities like Chicago and 
Pittsburgh, citizens came out into the streets, joined the railroad employees and protested 
a variety of injustices attributed to the railroads.  When the Governor of Pennsylvania 
sent the state militia to break up the strike, protestors set fire to railroad property and 
overturned locomotives.  Similar clashes occurred across the country and President 
Rutherford B. Hayes sent federal troops to restore order.  This marked the first time in 
history that an arm of the national military was used to dispel workers.  These riots 
resulted in the deaths of over forty people and an estimated $40 million in property 
damage.   

 
 

 
The Great Railroad Strike of 1877:  Pittsburgh Pa. 

 
 
By August of 1877, the Great Railroad Strike was over, but its effects are still debated by 
historians.  In some instances, the railroads restored wage cuts and improved some 
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working conditions.  However, many workers were fired or had their names placed on a 
blacklist, which was circulated to discourage hiring those who had participated in the 
strike.  Industrial plants also heightened security by employing and training their own 
guards.  The violence and property damage encouraged the U.S. government to establish 
the National Guard for the enforcement of order.  Armories, designed after European 
fortresses, were built in cities and towns across the country.  Ultimately, however, the 
Great Railroad Strike taught workers the power of unity and energized the movement 
toward labor unions.   
 

  Wages and Working Conditions (03:22)   
 
Go to Questions 1 through 7. 
 
 
The Rise of Labor Unions 
 
The first effective labor organization that acquired some national membership was the 
Knights of Labor.  Founded in 1869, the Knights enlisted all laborers and did not 
discriminate based on race, gender or field of employment.  They believed that ordinary 
people needed to have input into policies of the companies for which they worked and 
proposed the establishment of businesses owned by the workers.  Even though they 
viewed political action and education as the keys for accomplishing their goals, the 
Knights of Labor added the most members to their ranks following wildcat or 
spontaneous strikes.  For example, thousands of workers on the Southwest Railroad 
walked off their jobs in 1885 to protest wage cuts.  Afterwards, they telegraphed Terence 
Powderly, president of the Knights, and asked to join the organization.  This event 
increased membership in the Knights of Labor to 750,000 and enhanced their public 
image.  They used their status successfully to lobby Congress and acquired legislation to 
prohibit the entry into the United States of immigrants who had signed contracts to work 
for specific employers.  In spite of their achievements, the year 1886 was a troubled one 
for labor relations.  There were nearly 1600 strikes that involved over 600,000 workers, 
whose most prominent demand was the eight-hour day.  Although some strikes were 
considered successful, others failed; the organization also experienced internal conflicts 
between skilled and unskilled members.  These factors led to a decline in the popularity 
and influence of the Knights of Labor. 
 
 
The Haymarket Riot  
 
The most serious blow to the Knights of Labor came from a tragic occurrence with which 
they were only indirectly associated. One of the strikes called for May Day in 1886 was 
against the McCormick Harvesting Machine Company in Chicago.  Three unions, 
including the Knights of Labor, had struck against the plant, but the group represented by 
the Knights had reached an agreement and returned to work.  Fighting broke out along 
the picket lines on May 3; when police intervened to restore order, several strikers were 
injured or killed. Union leaders called a protest meeting at Chicago’s Haymarket Square 

http://connect.discoveryeducation.com/index.cfm?cdpartner=H11A-0110&cduser=41C3-AED9&blnpopup=1&guidAssetId=1607509B-D7BD-4127-B11A-7A521FE23777
http://connect.discoveryeducation.com/index.cfm?cdpartner=H11A-0110&cduser=41C3-AED9&blnpopup=1&guidAssetId=1607509B-D7BD-4127-B11A-7A521FE23777�
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for the evening of May 4.  As the meeting was breaking up, a group of anarchists took 
over and began to make inflammatory speeches. The police quickly intervened, but a 
bomb exploded.  The blast killed seven policemen and injured many others. Eight of the 
anarchists were arrested, tried, and convicted of murder. Four of them were hanged, and 
one committed suicide. The remaining three were pardoned in 1893 by Governor John P. 
Altgeld on the grounds that the anarchists had been convicted in a prejudicial atmosphere 
and that it was impossible to ascertain their guilt.  
 
 

 
Poster advertising the meeting at Haymarket Square 

 
 

The public blamed organized labor for the Haymarket tragedy, and many persons were 
convinced that the activities of unions were likely to be accompanied by violence. The 
Knights never regained the ground they lost in 1886, and organized labor seldom gained 
any measure of public sympathy until after the turn of the century.  Membership did not 
again reach 1885–86 levels until 1900. Unions, however, continued to be active, and 
1890s saw an average of 1000 strikes per year. 
 
Go to Questions 8 through 12. 
                                      
 
 
 The American Federation of Labor 
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As the power of the Knights declined, the leadership in the union movement passed to the 
American Federation of Labor (AFL).  First organized in 1881 and reorganized in 1886 
under the leadership of Samuel Gompers, this union was composed of groups of skilled 
workers or brotherhoods that practiced particular crafts and trades.   For a few years, 
there was some attempt at cooperation between the Knights and the AFL, but the basic 
structure and philosophy of the two groups made this difficult. The AFL appealed only to 
skilled workers, and its objectives were those of immediate concern to its members: 
hours, wages, working conditions, and the recognition of the union.  The key to achieving 
these goals was a negotiated agreement between the employer and a single unit of 
employees through a process called collective bargaining.  When this did not work, the 
AFL relied on economic weapons, chiefly the strike and boycott; it avoided political 
activity, except for state and local election campaigns.  Membership grew from 150,000 
workers in 1886 to over 1 million workers in 1900, but the organization’s reputation was 
tarnished by the events that occurred during the Homestead Steel Strike. 
 
 

 
 
 

  Labor Organizations (04:48) 

http://connect.discoveryeducation.com/index.cfm?cdpartner=H11A-0110&cduser=41C3-AED9&blnpopup=1&guidAssetId=2A77EE36-41A4-4B9D-AF51-FD5EA941CB95
http://connect.discoveryeducation.com/index.cfm?cdpartner=H11A-0110&cduser=41C3-AED9&blnpopup=1&guidAssetId=2A77EE36-41A4-4B9D-AF51-FD5EA941CB95�


 7 

 
 
 
The Homestead Steel Strike 
In 1892, a union affiliate of the AFL called for a strike against the Carnegie Steel 
Company’s Homestead plant to protest cuts in wages.  In an attempt to end the strike and 
the union, Henry Clay Frick, one of Carnegie’s top executives, locked out workers, built 
a three-mile wooden fence topped with barbed wire around the mill property and brought 
in three hundred Pinkerton guards to protect new workers hired as strikebreakers.  The 
arrival of the Pinkerton guards resulted in a gun battle that killed three guards and seven 
workers.  The Governor of Pennsylvania sent 4000 state militiamen to end the violence.  
Two weeks later, Frick was seriously wounded in an assassination attempt by Alexander 
Berkman, an anarchist with no union connections.  In the end, the strike lasted five 
months and was a victory for the company.  Although Frick recovered, prosperous 
Americans feared a worker uprising, and public opinion sided with the company.  
Employers took a strong stance against the unions by issuing yellow-dog contracts in 
which new employees promised not to join unions.  The steel industry remained without 
unions until the 1930s.  
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  Homestead Strike 1892 (02:39) 
 
 
Industrial Labor and the Pullman Strike     
By the 1890s, industrial unions began to gain support.  These organizations represented 
all the workers, both skilled and unskilled, within a particular industry.  The American 
Railway Union (ARU) was one example, and it called for one of the nation’s largest 
strikes of the nineteenth century in 1894.  The Pullman Palace Car Company, located 
near Chicago and owned by George Pullman, was the country’s largest manufacturer of 
sleeping cars for trains.  In response to a downturn in the economy, Pullman scheduled 
lay-offs for over one thousand employees and cut the salaries of the rest.  At the same 
time, he made no reduction in the rents charged to these workers for living in the 
company town of Pullman.  Ninety percent of the company’s work force voted to go on 
strike, and the action quickly spread nationwide when members of the American Railway 

http://connect.discoveryeducation.com/index.cfm?cdpartner=H11A-0110&cduser=41C3-AED9&blnpopup=1&guidAssetId=29AF4938-3753-42D1-B4D5-B7AA7181FB59
http://connect.discoveryeducation.com/index.cfm?cdpartner=H11A-0110&cduser=41C3-AED9&blnpopup=1&guidAssetId=29AF4938-3753-42D1-B4D5-B7AA7181FB59�
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Union refused to move trains with Pullman cars.  Soon more than 250,000 railroad 
employees had joined the effort.   
 
 

 
 
 

 
With much of the country’s rail traffic at a standstill, company executives requested 
assistance from the national government.  The federal courts issued an injunction, which 
demanded that the strikers return to work.  President Grover Cleveland enforced this 
order by sending 14,000 U.S. troops to control the situation.  In Chicago, a crowd of 
10,000 protestors came out to meet them.  This confrontation resulted in twenty-five 
deaths and in over sixty serious injuries.  Hundreds found themselves in jail along with 
Eugene V. Debs, the leader of the American Railway Union.  Following his arrest, 
support for the strike quickly faded, and the Pullman firm succeeded in lowering wages.  
It also gave business a powerful, new tactic, with the use of injunctions to stop strikes. 
 
Go to Questions 13 through 22 
 
 
What’s Next? 
Industrial expansion within the United States and the accompanying demand for workers 
set people in motion at home and abroad.  Greater job opportunities lured farmers from 
the country to the city, and many African Americans left the rural South for the urban 
North.  Immigrants crossed both the Atlantic and the Pacific in the hope of finding better 
lives.  In the period between the Civil War and World War I, over twenty-five million 
immigrants entered the United States; the 1900 census showed that, in New York and San 
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Francisco, more than 75% of the population had at least one parent who was foreign-
born.  Dramatic changes resulting from all of this movement were inevitable, and you 
will explore the impact of this mass movement in the next unit.  Before moving on, 
review the names and terms that you read about in this unit; then, complete questions  
 
Go to Questions 23 through 30. 
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